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almost all the way to the summit of Beinn Franey. Because you can see, there's a
ridge covered in deciduous trees, with some rock poking through it there. Then it
seems to go back over that ridge and then up the cliff to the top of Beinn Franey.
Now, cliffs are not very stable phenomena. They tend to get eroded away quite
quickly. And I wouldn't be surprised if this whole face of the mountain is actually
one large landslide that slid hundreds, or probably thousands, of years ago. The
boulders themselves have fallen off the landslide itself. We can tell that these
boulders have not moved far for a long time, because they're covered by a thick
growth of different li? chens and reindeer moss. I suspect that if you turned some of
these boulders over, you would see a much fresher and much less lichen-encrusted
rock underneath them. They're here to stay, basically. A few of them have been
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obviously been here and turned them around. You see the pink fresh gra? nite
showing through there, on the under? sides of some of them. And I don't think those
have fallen recently at all. The whole slope looks fairly stable. The trees are growing
up through it. The trees have got good clean bark on the up-slope side, so the slope
is no longer falling. Maybe most of it came down when the landslide happened
initially. (We're not talking about something that took place in any kind of recorded
memory, though, these slides....) No. There was one large slide that took place, we
think, in 1904, on the North Mountain on the Sun? rise Valley. You see it as you
drive along the Cabot Trail between Cape North and the warden's station at the
Aspy Intervale. There's a big clear, cleaned-off ridge of granite showing through
there.  There have been some samples taken of trees that were killed in that
landslide. And, counting the tree rings, they were able to date it back to about
1904. And we know that there was an earthquake in the area around 1904, so the
two have been correlated together. The landslide probably happened at the
earthquake. But that was the only known large landslide of this scale, in recorded
history. This one, I would think, is prob? ably a few thousands of years ago. The
origin of this whole mountain, of the rock that made this whole mountain, is what
we have called the Cameron Brook gra? nodiorite. Cameron Brook is a little brook
that flows down through Ingonish. And the Cameron Brook granodiorite is the name
of this granite mass which forms a great cir? cular blob underneath Ingonish,
extending inland a ways. The rock itself--we've been able to date it by analyzing the
uranium and lead isotopes--it's 403 million years WE HAVE INFORMATION ON YOUR
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