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Ranald; Did you have storytellers out around here or what kind of stories did you ? 
Jimmy; Oh, there was quite a good storyteller. There was an old Maclntyre • old Dan
Maclntyre and Lauchie MacDonald.  Lena; Yes, he'd start to tell a story. He smoked
a pipe, you know, and he had those long pieces of wood that he'd cut off just for
lighting the pipe, that he'd put in the Water? loo stove. So he'd sit down in front of
the Waterloo and he'd start to tell this story. And he'd put the wood stick in the fire
to get the match to light his pipe. And he'd go get his pipe and he'd light it emd put
it down. He'd be telling the story. That's the only puff he ever took out of it. By the
time he went to take another puff, the light would be out again. Jimmy; He'd have to
light it again.  Flora; Western Dan, wasn't he good at telling stories? Jimmy; Yeah.
Well, he was out west there emd the stories he told, you couldn't believe them
though. Flora; And your Uncle Dan  Jim Sampson Motors  132 TOWNSEND STREET,
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terrific at telling sto? ries. Oh, I remember going over to visit just to hear your Uncle
Dan tell stories. Ranald; What kind of stories did they tell? Flora; Well, he sailed a
lot. Jimmy; Oh, anything that would •  stories eJbout different people around here. 
Lena; I remember one time, he told a story about when he was out west and they
planted potatoes. When it came time to dig potatoes, they carried them into their
cellar and piled them up but the potatoes were so big, they piled them up like wood.
 Jimmy; And there's Western  Dem Lena; Western Dan,  that's the guy. Jummy;
Western Dan, he was out west. There were an awful lot of geese out on the prairies,
you know, in the wheat fields. And he went out there one night. He went to shoot
some geese. He took a doxible-barreled shotgun and he went out. Oh, he fired and
down they come. He never came home that night, the man. So they went next day,
they went looking for him. Couldn't find him. They saw this pile • pile of birds out in
the field. They went out and spotted geese on the field. They started digging the
pile out. Here he was xm- demeath the pile.  'U-Of'eOf'a'  "Lite Is What You Make It!"
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